
 

 
The fo
Beach 
 
To: The
 
BBLA c
attenti
for dis
that pu
effects
certain
well as
recove
comm
restora
not cre
state le
legislat
so that
 
BBLA a
making
fund. I
renting
 
Identif
approp
this se
ways o
to sup
 
As for 
per ye
having
Town h
Town’s
the rev
propos
genera

llowing letter
Landowners 

e Town Coun

commends th
ion a critically
aster recover
urpose are no
s on ocean lev
n to occur fro
s residents, th
ery and beach
unity for the 
ation projects
eate reserve f
egislators to e
tors are likely
t those who h

also commen
g information
n essence, th
g beach umbr

fying a proble
priate solutio
cond matter,

of funding a re
plant a privat

alternative so
ar for a five y

g to take on th
has no prior e
s general reve
venue that w
sal, concessio
al expenses w

Bethany
PO B

        

r was adopted
Association (

cil and Town 

he Town Man
y important is
ry purposes a
ot available. N
vels, serious s
m time to tim

he Bethany Be
h preservation
foreseeable f
s may well be
funds for thes
eliminate fun
y to cut or elim
have made no

ds the Town 
n available on
he staff’s sugg
rellas and cha

em, such as th
n or set of so
, BBLA believe
eserve. We fu
tely owned bu

olutions, we n
year period. T
he burdens an
experience or
enues so that
ould otherwi

on fees from a
would have to

y Beach Lan
Box 401, Be

                 

d by electron
BBLA) on Thu

Manager of 

ager and his d
ssue, namely,
s well as bea

No matter ho
storms that re

me in the futu
each we all k
n are and will
future. Moreo
e numbered. S
se purposes b

nding for such
minate fundin
o plans to add

Manager and
n the staff’s th
gestion is to r
airs with a mu

he need for a 
olutions to tha
es the Town o
urther believe
usiness with a

note that Mr.
That money co
nd financial r
r expertise. In
t putting futu
se be availab
a private busi

o be found. (W

ndowners A
ethany Bea

  

          Nove

        

ic vote by the
ursday, Novem

Bethany Beac

dedicated sta
, the need to 
ch restoratio
w one views 
esult in exten

ure. Without a
now and love
l remain the s
over, the day
Some have ar
because doin
h projects. Th
ng no matter 
dress that like

d his staff for 
hinking as to h
eplace the pr
unicipally own

reserve fund
at problem is 
ought to give 
e that there a
a municipal o

. Steen’s curr
ould be used
isks associate

n the past, co
re concession
le for genera
iness would d

We note in pa

Association
ach, DE  19

ember 13, 2

                  

e Board of Dir
mber 13, 201

ch:  

aff for bringin
create a rese
n and mainte
the debate o

nsive beach d
an attractive 
e would cease
single most im
ys of federal a
rgued that co
g so will only
e problem wi
 what munici
elihood will s

the openness
how to addre
rivately owne
ned and oper

d, is one thing
 another and
very serious 

are serious iss
operation that

ent bid offers
to fund a res

ed with opera
ncession reve
n fees into a r
l Town expen

disappear so t
ssing that the

(BBLA) 
9930  

2014   

      

rectors of the
14. 

ng into focus a
erve fund tha
enance if othe
over climate c

amage and e
beach for vac

e to exist. Thu
mportant prio
and state fund
oastal commu
y encourage fe
ith that argum
ipalities may 
uffer the mos

s they have d
ess the need f
ed and operat
rated busines

g. Finding the 
 quite distinc
consideratio

sues raised by
t merit carefu

s the Town ro
serve without
ating a busine
enue has gon
reserve fund 
nses. But und
that other me
e staff’s proje

 

e Bethany 

and to public 
t can be used

er funds for 
change and its
rosion are 
cationers, as 
us, disaster 
orities for this
ding for beac
unities should
ederal and 
ment is that 
or may not d
st.  

displayed in 
for a reserve 
ted business o
ss. 

most 
ct matter. On 
n to alternati
y the proposa
ul study. 

oughly $75,00
t the Town 
ess in which t
ne into the 

would reduc
er the staff’s 
eans of fundi
ection of a “n

d 

s 

s 
h 

d 

o, 

of 

ive 
al 

00 

he 

e 

ng 
et 



gain” of $200,000 annually from a municipally operated rental business fails to take into account 
the $75,000 in revenue that the Town would lose as a result of displacing the private business that 
would have paid those fees. Thus the true “net gain,” if the staff’s estimates and projections are 
otherwise correct, is $125,000.) 
 
Other alternatives also merit investigation and consideration. Perhaps the Town could negotiate 
higher concession fees. A rental tax could be imposed for renting beach equipment just as we 
impose rental taxes on real property. Existing taxes on beach house and hotel rentals might be 
increased and the increased revenue (or possibly some or all of the revenue generated by the 
current tax rates) could be dedicated to funding a reserve. Expenditures in other areas of lower 
priority possibly could be reduced to make money available for a reserve fund. We are not 
advocating or endorsing any specific measures along these lines. Rather we are simply trying to 
illustrate issues that need to be considered. 
 
Replacing a privately owned and operated business with a newly created municipally owned and 
operated business is another very serious matter that warrants through study and consideration. 
There are a great many coastal communities between Bethany Beach and North Myrtle Beach, 
and many more to the north of us. How many of those communities have municipally owned and 
operated businesses that rent beach equipment? Of those that do have municipal ownership, how 
has that worked out, not only for the town government but also in terms of consumer 
satisfaction? Have any of the communities that do not currently have such municipal businesses 
studied the matter or tried municipal ownership in the past?   
 
Finally, if a privately owned rental business was doing a poor job and if competent entrepreneurs 
could not be found to run such a business, municipal ownership might well be the only reasonable 
solution. But none of that applies here. Mr. Steen and his family have successfully operated their 
beach rental business here for many years without, so far as we know, any serious or numerous 
complaints about the adequacy of their service. (One can only wish that the same could be said of 
our cable television service.) The time worn admonition that “if it ain’t broke, don’t fix it,” while 
by no means an absolute rule, is entitled to at least some weight in assessing the staff’s proposal.  
In sum, BBLA believes there is a clear and compelling case to be made for creating a reserve fund 
to deal with such contingencies as beach restoration and other disaster related problems. But 
finding the best way or ways of generating the money needed for such a reserve fund is in our 
view a very complex, multi-dimensional problem. It requires very careful, in-depth study.   
 
We would support the creation of a committee to study the issues and come up with detailed 
recommendations based on solid research. We would welcome the opportunity to participate in 
such a committee. In the meantime, we believe the Town should negotiate with Mr. Steen in an 
effort to resolve this matter and achieve a mutually satisfactory outcome. 
 
Very truly yours, 
/s/ 
Michael Horne, 
President, BBLA 
 
 
 
 
 

 


